
Brazil CPD 2024-2027-  Evaluation Plan Rationale  

CO’s Brazil evaluation plan for the CPD 2024-28 demonstrates an appropriate and comprehensive coverage of its programme portfolio and is aligned with the 

country's priorities. The plan includes all mandatory evaluations and contributes to the accountability, learning, and strategic results of the office. 

On a macro level, the planned evaluations are directly related to the three directions of change outlined in UNDP's Strategic Plan 2022-2025, contributing to the 

delivery of signature solutions. Moreover, it supports the outcomes agreed in the UNSDCF, signed in 2023, contributing to the country’s development priorities. 

The distribution of evaluations in the plan reflects the relevance of government cost-sharing projects in Brazil. The 8 evaluations planned under Outcome 4 (related 

to peace, justice, and governance) evidences the growing participation of the Brazilian Judiciary System in our portfolio, especially the partnership with the National 

Justice Council (CNJ). 

The evaluations planned for Outcome 3 (4 in total) and GEF projects (7), reflect Brazil’s leading role in climate and environmental development projects. As this 

relevance is expected to return to previous levels and possibly grow in the upcoming years with the elected government in 2022, accurate data and 

recommendations are crucial. 

Evaluations under Outcome 2 (4) indicate CO’s Brazil significant contribution to the institutional strengthening of Brazilian institutions to deliver effective public 

policies and social protection schemes, ensuring that no one is left behind.  

For Outcome 1, 2 evaluations support assessing our actions toward sustainable and transformative economies.  One of the evaluations will be thematic, focusing 

on UNDP’s Brazil support towards economic transformation, including projects with the following counterparts: the Ministry of Economy, the Ministry of Planning, 

and the Administrative Council for Economic Defense. 

Overall, the plan’s 26 evaluations provide a holistic approach, including partners involved and evaluation budgets as required. 

 

UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 

Midterm 
Evaluation - 
BRA/19/005 - 
GCF REDD+  

Donors 
(GCF) and 
MMA 

GCF GCF Feb 2024 80,000 Donor 
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Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
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by 

Type of 
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funding 

to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

uncertainty 
and risk. 

Outcome #2 By 2027, Brazil will 
have expanded and strengthened 
social protection and other public 
policies to be more intersectoral, 
inclusive, participatory and 
effective, evidence-based, 
attentive to groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability and 
oriented, at all levels of 
government, to respect for human 
rights and the reduction of poverty, 
hunger and inequalities of groups 
and people in situations of 
vulnerability and the promotion of 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development  

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/10/008 
Projeto de 
estruturação da 
vigilância 
sanitária 

ANVISA ANVISA Project Mar 2024 40,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
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Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 
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evaluation 

Planned 
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Estimated 
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generational, gender, racial and 
ethnic equality and environmental 
and social sustainable 
development. 
Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 
social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development  

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/15/004 IST, 
HIV/aids e 
hepatites virais 

MS MS Project Apr 2024 45,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 

Terminal 
evaluation-  
BRA/20/015 
Justiça 4.0 

CNJ UNDP Project Apr 2024 30,000 Project 
budget 
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by 
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cost 
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funding 

social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Midterm 
evaluation - 
BRA/21/G31 - 
PCBs 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
MMA 

GEF GEF May 2024 50,000 Donor 
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Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
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by 
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evaluation 
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Provisional 
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considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome #1 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the economic 
transformation that is sustainable, 
inclusive and responsive to issues 
of generations, gender, race and 
ethnicity, with the insertion of the 
socio-environmental dimension in 
the productive chains with 
improved productivity, inserting 
itself in the ongoing technological 
and digital transformation, and 
expanding national 
competitiveness and development 
of human capacities. 

Outcome 1: 
Structural 
transformation 
accelerated, 
particularly 
green, 
inclusive and 
digital 
transitions;  

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/21/011 
Gest. Prop. Est. 
União - 
Desestatização 

MP   Project Jun 2024 30,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/16/G76 
HCFC PBH II 

Donors 
(Multilateral 
Fund) and 
MMA 

  MP Jun 2024 50,000 Project 
budget 
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traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 
social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/18/016 
CADE II 

CADE   Project Jul 2024 20,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/18/G31 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
MMA 

GEF GEF Aug 2024 60,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
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by 
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mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Phytotherapic 
Value Chains 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 
social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/18/024 
Redução 
violência contra 
criança e 
adolescente 

MDH   Project Aug 2024 20,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 
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evaluation 
completion 
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Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
capacities and institutional 
articulation with expansion of 
social  participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generation, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence,  and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/18/019 
Sistema Prisional 
Socioeducativo 

MJ   Project Sep 2024 25,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #1 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the economic 
transformation that is sustainable, 
inclusive and responsive to issues 

Outcome 1: 
Structural 
transformation 
accelerated, 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/18/023 

MF   Project Sep 2024 20,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

of generations, gender, race and 
ethnicity, with the insertion of the 
socio-environmental dimension in 
the productive chains with 
improved productivity, inserting 
itself in the ongoing technological 
and digital transformation, and 
expanding national 
competitiveness and development 
of human capacities. 

particularly 
green, 
inclusive and 
digital 
transitions;  

Modernização da 
Economia 

Outcome #2By 2027, Brazil will 
have expanded and strengthened 
social protection and other public 
policies to be more intersectoral, 
inclusive, participatory and 
effective, evidence-based, 
attentive to groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability and 
oriented, at all levels of 
government, to respect for human 
rights and the reduction of poverty, 
hunger and inequalities of groups 
and people in situations of 
vulnerability and the promotion of 
generational, gender, racial and 
ethnic equality and environmental 
and social sustainable 
development. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development  

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/20/022 
Capacidade SUS 
SCTIE/MS 

MS   Project Oct 2024 40,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
capacities and institutional 
articulation with expansion of 
social  participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generation, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence,  and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/20/003 PjE 

CNJ   Project Oct 2024 25,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
capacities and institutional 
articulation with expansion of 
social  participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generation, gender, 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/20/016 
Metodologias 
integradas seg. 
Pub e def social 

MJ   Project Feb 2025 20,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence,  and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

human agency 
and human 
development 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Midterm 
evaluation - 
BRA/23/G31 5th 
National 
Communication 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
MCTIC 

GEF GEF Feb 2025 40,000 Donor 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

Outcome #1 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the economic 
transformation that is sustainable, 
inclusive and responsive to issues 
of generations, gender, race and 
ethnicity, with the insertion of the 
socio-environmental dimension in 
the productive chains with 
improved productivity, inserting 
itself in the ongoing technological 
and digital transformation, and 
expanding national 
competitiveness and development 
of human capacities. 

Outcome 1: 
Structural 
transformation 
accelerated, 
particularly 
green, 
inclusive and 
digital 
transitions;  

Midterm 
evaluation - 
BRA/22/009 
Banco de 
Projetos POA 

POA   Project May 2025 20,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Midterm 
evaluation - 
BRA/20/G31 7th 
Phase of Small 
Grants Programe 
in Brazil 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
ISPN 

GEF GEF Jul 2025 70,000 Donor 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  
Outcome #2 By 2027, Brazil will 
have expanded and strengthened 
social protection and other public 
policies to be more intersectoral, 
inclusive, participatory and 
effective, evidence-based, 
attentive to groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability and 
oriented, at all levels of 
government, to respect for human 
rights and the reduction of poverty, 
hunger and inequalities of groups 
and people in situations of 
vulnerability and the promotion of 
generation equality, gender, race 
and ethnicity and social and 
environmental sustainable 
development. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development  

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/22/003 PPP 
MS II 

MS   Project Sep 2025 20,000 Project 
budget 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/22/002 
Reflorestamento 
Pernambuco 

PE   Project Apr 2026 30,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/19/005 - 
GCF REDD+  

Donors 
(GCF) and 
MMA 

GCF GCF May 2026 95,000 Donor 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/20/G31 7th 
Phase of Small 
Grants Programe 
in Brazil 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
ISPN 

GEF GEF Jun 2026 80,000 Donor 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 
social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/12/002 
Apoio ao Setor 
Algodoeiro 

Donors 
(Instituto 
Brasileiro do 
Algodão) 
and ABC 

  Project Jul 2026 50,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 
race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development 

Outcome #2 By 2027, Brazil will 
have expanded and strengthened 
social protection and other public 
policies to be more intersectoral, 
inclusive, participatory and 
effective, evidence-based, 
attentive to groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability and 
oriented, at all levels of 
government, to respect for human 
rights and the reduction of poverty, 
hunger and inequalities of groups 
and people in situations of 
vulnerability and the promotion of 
generational, gender, racial and 
ethnic equality and environmental 
and social sustainable 
development. 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 
human agency 
and human 
development  

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/22/006 ANA 

ANA   Project Sep 2026 20,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/21/G31 - 
PCBs 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
MMA 

GEF GEF Feb 2027 40,000 Donor 

Outcome #4 By 2027 Brazil will 
have strengthened, within the 
framework of the democratic rule 
of law, its governance, legislation, 
institutional capacities and 
articulation with expansion of 
social participation to elaborate 
and execute public policies based 
on evidence, human rights and 
equality of generations, gender, 

Outcome 2: No 
one left 
behind, 
centering on 
equitable 
access to 
opportunities 
and a rights-
based 
approach to 

Terminal 
Evaluation - 
BRA/13/008 
Consolidação da 
Cooperação 
Técnica Sul-Sul 
brasileira 

Donors 
(Instituto 
Brasileiro do 
Algodão) 
and ABC 

  Project May 2027 55,000 Project 
budget 



UNSDCF Outcome UNDP 
Strategic Plan 
outcome 

Evaluation title Partners  Evaluation  
commissioned 
by 

Type of 
evaluation 

Planned 
evaluation 
completion 
date 

Estimated 
cost 

Provisional 
source of 
funding 

race and ethnicity, with a view to 
preventing and confronting 
corruption, crime and multiple 
forms of violence, and oriented to 
the specificities of the territory and 
transparency, with innovation, 
national and international 
cooperation, and broad 
participation of society. 

human agency 
and human 
development 

Outcome #3 By 2027, Brazil will 
have advanced in the 
implementation of initiatives to 
mitigate climate change and adapt 
to its effects, reducing 
deforestation and risks of disasters, 
considering groups and people in 
situations of vulnerability, 
including those forcely displaced , 
with generation, gender, race and 
ethnicity equality approach, and 
protection of indigenous lands, 
traditional communities, rural, 
forest and riverside populations, 
aiming at promoting a resilient and 
decarbonized economy, 
considering national legislation and 
aligned with international 
commitments.  

Outcome 3: 
Resilience built 
to respond to 
systemic 
uncertainty 
and risk. 

Terminal 
evaluation - 
BRA/23/G31 5th 
National 
Communication 

Donors 
(GEF) and 
MCTIC 

GEF GEF Aug 2027 65,000 Donor 

Total  1,140,000 
 


